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Introduction: The Journey to Deeper Faith ?

Studying the Bible is a life-changing journey for every believer. It helps us deepen
our understanding of God, His love, and His purpose for us. This plan will guide
you through key themes in the Bible, focusing on application, reflection, and
spiritual growth. As 2 Timothy 3:16 reminds us, “All Scripture is God-breathed and
is useful for teaching, rebuking, correcting, and training in righteousness.” Let’s
dive in, with hearts open to receive God’s wisdom!

Week 1: Understanding God’s Creation ?

Begin with the foundation: Creation. Genesis 1–2 takes us through the powerful
creation of the universe, where God spoke everything into existence. Reflect on
the beauty and order of God’s creation and how everything He made is “good”
(Genesis 1:31). How can you see God’s creativity and purpose in your daily life?

Week 2: The Fall and God’s Plan of Redemption ??

In Genesis 3, we learn about the fall of humanity and how sin entered the world.
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Despite Adam and Eve’s disobedience, God had a plan of redemption through
Jesus. Romans 5:8 says, “But God demonstrates his own love for us in this: While
we were still sinners, Christ died for us.” Reflect on how God’s grace and love
remain constant, even in our failures.

Week 3: Faith and Obedience – The Story of Abraham ?

Abraham’s journey in Genesis 12 shows us what it means to live by faith. God
called him to leave everything behind and trust His plan. Hebrews 11:8 explains,
“By faith Abraham, when called to go to a place he would later receive as his
inheritance, obeyed and went, even though he did not know where he was going.”
What areas of your life is God asking you to trust Him with right now?

Week 4: The Power of Prayer – Hannah’s Story ?

In 1 Samuel 1, Hannah’s heartfelt prayer for a child shows us the power of
persistence in prayer. God not only answered her prayer, but also gave her a son,
Samuel, who would become a great prophet. James 5:16 reminds us that “The
prayer of a righteous person is powerful and effective.” How has God answered
prayers in your life, and how can you deepen your prayer life?

Week 5: The Life and Teachings of Jesus ?

Explore Jesus’ teachings, parables, and miracles in the Gospels. Matthew 5–7,
the Sermon on the Mount, is a rich text to understand the heart of God. Jesus
teaches about loving our enemies, giving to the needy, and praying with sincerity.
Matthew 5:14-16 calls us to be “the light of the world.” In what ways can you be a
light in your community, reflecting Jesus’ teachings?

Week 6: Living in the Spirit – The Acts of the Apostles ?

The book of Acts reveals the Holy Spirit empowering the early church. Acts 2
describes Pentecost, where the disciples received the Holy Spirit, enabling them
to boldly share the Gospel. Galatians 5:22-23 reminds us of the fruits of the Spirit,
like love, joy, and peace. What fruit of the Spirit do you need to cultivate more in
your life?
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Week 7: Walking in Love – Paul’s Letters to the Churches ?

Paul’s letters are filled with encouragement and correction for the early churches.
In 1 Corinthians 13, we find the famous passage on love: “Love is patient, love is
kind… It does not envy, it does not boast…” (1 Corinthians 13:4-7). Reflect on
how you can embody Christ’s love in your relationships with others.

Week 8: The Promise of Eternal Life – Revelation ??

The final book of the Bible, Revelation, speaks about the hope we have in Christ.
Despite the trials of this life, Revelation 21:4 promises, “He will wipe every tear
from their eyes. There will be no more death or mourning or crying or pain, for the
old order of things has passed away.” How does this promise shape your view of
eternity?

Conclusion: Building a Life on God’s Word ?

As we close this study, remember Jesus’ words in Matthew 7:24-25: “Everyone
who hears these words of mine and puts them into practice is like a wise man who
built his house on the rock.” Let your life be firmly rooted in Scripture, growing
deeper in faith as you apply God’s Word daily.

Salvation Prayers : Dear Lord Jesus, I come to you today acknowledging my 
need for salvation. I confess that I have sinned and fallen short of your glory. But I 
believe that you died for my sins and rose again. I ask that you come into my 
heart and be my Lord. I commit to following you and living for you every day. 
Thank you for your love and for the gift of eternal life. In your name I pray, Amen.
Amen If you prayed the above prayers kindly click here to get more information 
https://www.xgospel.net/harvest_form/form/?page=0&salvation=true 

Search for any text or verse in the bible
Example: Joy, Love, 1 John 1:3
▾https://www.xgospel.net/bible-search/

Multiple Choice Questions
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1. What did God declare about His creation in Genesis 1:31?

a) It was incomplete

b) It was “good”

c) It was “okay”

d) It needed improvement

2. Who is the father of faith mentioned in the Bible, whose journey of trust is
highlighted in Genesis 12?

a) Moses

b) David

c) Abraham

d) Isaac

3. In which book of the Bible does Jesus deliver the Sermon on the Mount?

a) Mark

b) Luke

c) John

d) Matthew

4. According to James 5:16, whose prayer is powerful and effective?

a) A believer

b) A righteous person

c) A teacher
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d) A Pharisee

5. What does Revelation 21:4 promise about the new heaven and new earth?

a) No more tears or death

b) No more sin

c) A new Jerusalem

d) All of the above

Discussion Questions

1. How has God’s creation in Genesis influenced your understanding of His power
and creativity?

2. What personal challenges have helped you to rely more on God’s grace, as
seen in the story of the fall?

3. How does Abraham’s example of faith challenge you to step out in obedience,
even when the future is uncertain?

4. What role does prayer play in your daily life, and how can you grow in your
prayer discipline?

5. How do you stay grounded in the teachings of Jesus while navigating everyday
life challenges.

Frequently Asked Questions

(FAQs)

1. How long should I dedicate to each study session?

A good guideline is 30 minutes to an hour, depending on the depth you want to go
into each topic.
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2. Can I do this study with a group?

Absolutely! Bible studies are a great way to connect with other believers and
share insights.

3. What if I miss a week?

No worries! Simply pick up where you left off. Consistency is key, but it’s okay to
move at your own pace.

4. Do I need any extra materials?

A Bible, a journal for notes, and a heart open to God’s leading are all you need!

5. How can I apply what I’ve learned to everyday life?

Take time to reflect on each lesson and ask the Holy Spirit to show you areas
where you can grow in faith and action.

Multiple Choice Answers

1. b) It was “good”

2. c) Abraham

3. d) Matthew

4. b) A righteous person

5. d) All of the above
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